
Tuesday, March 14, 2023 
Announcements 

Attention Students:  If you are experiencing technical 
issues with your school issued Chromebook, please come by 
the Library during LUNCH ONLY for technical support. 
 
 
 
 
 
Dons:  Tomorrow is a Regular Day Schedule.  1st period 
bell will ring at 8:25.  Don’t be late! 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Students and Staff:  Tomorrow is College Gear Day.  Don’t 
forget to wear your college gear every Wednesday. 
 
Hello Sierra Vista High School Students!  In our efforts to 
maximize the instructional time of our students, deliveries 
or drop offs of any type are NOT allowed.  In addition, 
food deliveries to the campus for students are 
PROHIBITED.  Any item (food, materials, etc.) requesting 
to be dropped off by a parent/guardian or delivery by any 
restaurant or affiliate (Door Dash, Uber Eats, Grub Hub, 
etc.) will NOT be accepted by the staff of Sierra Vista High 
School.  Please make sure you have all of your school/
athletic items/materials needed for the school day before 
leaving the house.  Thank you for your support. 
 
Are you a 10th, 11th or 12th Grader?  Waste Management 
Baldwin Park is looking for committed and hardworking 
students for a PAID Internship.  You need to meet the 
following criteria: 
 *A resident of Baldwin Park 
 *At least 16 years of age by the start of the  
   Internship 
 *Have an unweighted grade point average of 3.0+ 
 *Participate in a virtual interview with  
   Waste Management 
 *Able to provide a work permit if selected 
Deadline to apply is April 30th.  Application can be found 
in the Google Classrooms. 

Athletics 

Frosh Baseball vs South El Monte 
  @ South El Monte - 3:30 
 
 
 
JV & Varsity Baseball vs South El Monte 
  @ Sierra Vista - 3:30 
 
Varsity Softball vs Workman 
  @ Sierra Vista - 3:30 
 
 
 
Varsity Swim vs Duarte 
  @ Duarte - 3:30 
 
 
 
Boys Varsity Tennis vs Nogales 
  @ Sierra Vista - 2:15 
 
 
 
Boys JV & Varsity Volleyball   
  @ Sierra Vista - 3:30 
 
 

Sports 

Interested in playing Football for the 2023 season but you 
are hesitant because you have never played or have no 
prior experience?  Don’t let this stop you from making a 
true high school experience.  We will teach you everything 
you need to know to play at the highest level.  We are 
looking for new players for the 2023 season.  We are 
especially looking for current 9th and 10th graders.  There 
will be a meeting in Room 518 on Wednesday, March 15th, 
at Lunch for all those who are interested.  See you on 
March 15th and Go Dons!! 
 
 
 

Clubs & Activities 

Attention Students:  The Fishing Club will be having a 
meeting TODAY at Lunch in Mr. Toohey’s class, Room 
512.  We will be discussing fishing tackle and potential 
planning for a fishing trip!  Please stop by and join us! 
 
 
 
 
NAMI will be having a club meeting on Wednesday during 
Lunch in Room 608.  Join us for some destressing activities! 



Faculty Section 

Group D has duty this week 

 

Please Release The Following 

 Frosh Baseball  

@ 1:15 

Varsity Swim  

@ 1:15 

Boys Varsity Tennis 

@ 1:15 

JV & Varsity Baseball 

@ 2:00 

Varsity Softball 

@ 2:00 

Boys JV & Varsity Volleyball 

@ 2:30 

Tuesday, March 14, 2023  


